

# Exhibit B

Name: Tony Kourianos    SSN: xxx-xx-7452    File No. 112072

Total Hours:

111.00

7/1/2019	Received in the mail 3 copies of the RO's petition to the Supreme Court of the United States. Also, Mr. Wolfe forwarded me an email with the petition and appendix attached. I saved and printed it - gave a hard copy of the brief to Rachel and kept one for myself. Emailed to Victoria also. (BA)	0.25
7/1/2019	Received in certified mail today 3 copies of the RO's petition to the Supreme Court of the United Stated. It appears we have the option to submit a brief within 30 days, then the case will get submitted to the Court for review. (VSH)	0.50
7/1/2019	Spent 2.5 hours reviewing the RO's petition. Drafted an outline of the arguments to simplify the issues. Save to the drive. (BA)	2.50
7/3/2019	Printed off and reviewed rules of the Supreme Court to file Mr. Wolfe's Motion of Appearance. (RW)	0.25
7/3/2019	Today, Rachel and I reviewed the rules of the US Supreme Court for Filing. We then contacted the VA Supreme Court regarding the letter of good standing. Sent a letter requesting the letter of good standing. Contacted Mark Solomon for him to sign our request to be admitted. We discussed this with Victoria who also sent hers over. Drafted a notice of appearance putting Mr. Wolfe as counsel of record. Drafted cover letter and saved all to the drive. (BA)	3.00
7/3/2019	Submitted Notice of Appearance, Certified to Supreme Court Clerk. (ASB)	0.00
7/6/2019	Spent 3 hours reviewing the RO's Petition for Writ of Certiorari and some of the prior briefs submitted by the office to SCOTUS for formatting, etc. I also did some research on the Court's website as to rules and requirements for Respondent briefs in case something had changed. (VSH)	3.00
7/8/2019	Received Notice of Docketing. Saved to the drive. (ASB)	0.00

7/8/2019	Received the Notice of Docketing from the RO via email today. Saved to file. Also got an email from BA with his Notice of Docketing. Saved his to file as well. (VSH)	0.25
7/9/2019	Received and review of email from BA. Placed brief due on the calendar for Aug 1, 2019. (MJT)	0.00
7/21/2019	Worked on brief; reviewed of the outline of RO's arguments that Brad put together previously and saved to the drive and re-reviewed the RO's petition itself, organized and drafted the initial sections of the brief, began the Statement of the Case section. (VSH)	4.00
7/22/2019	Spent 3 hours today reviewing and trying to organize the initial sections of the brief and working on the summary of the argument section and update it to include the new arguments. (VSH)	3.00
7/23/2019	Call to the Clerk's office today regarding submitting our motion electronically. Discussed the log-ins with Mr. Wolfe and decided to request an extension of the brief. Emailed the RO about the extension and tried to contact the Solicitor General's office - no answer. Began drafting the motion for extension. (VSH)	1.00
7/24/2019	Printed application for extension with service sheet from Victoria. Got Mr. Wolfe to sign and emailed it back to Victoria. (NAH)	0.25
7/24/2019	Spent 9 hours working on the first argument section of the brief. (VSH)	9.00
7/25/2019	Worked on the second argument and did research to back up our arguments. (VSH)	8.50
7/26/2019	Continued working on brief. (VSH)	2.00
7/30/2019	Continued working on the brief. (VSH)	5.00
8/8/2019	Submitted request to be admitted via overnight mail. (ASB)	0.25
8/12/2019	Email regarding due date of the brief. (VSH)	0.25

8/23/2019	Confirmed with the United States Supreme Court that all 3 of us have been admitted as of today. (VSH)	0.25
8/24/2019	Continued working on brief. (VSH)	5.00
8/25/2019	Continued working on brief. (VSH)	10.00
8/26/2019	Continued working on brief. (VSH)	13.00
8/27/2019	Continued working on brief. (VSH)	5.75
8/27/2019	Discussed the case with Brad. (VSH)	0.75
8/28/2019	Received confirmation today via SCOTUS clerk the Solicitors General's request for extension had been granted and it included our brief.	0.25
8/28/2019	Continued working on brief. (VSH)	4.00
9/3/2019	Received letter dated 8/28/19 from the US Department of Justice regarding the petition for Writ of Certiorari filed June 28, 2019 and placed on Docket July 2, 2019. (JEW)	0.25
9/30/2019	Finished rough draft of response brief. (VSH)	7.00
10/1/2019	Reviewed edited Victoria's supreme Court brief. (RW)	1.50
10/3/2019	Worked on the TOA/TOC and wrote the summary of the argument. (VSH)	5.50
10/3/2019	Went over the edits from Rachel, updated internal Appx citations and finished brief. (VSH)	1.25
10/3/2019	Received the proof back from Cockle. Made changes and sent back for a final edit/printing approval. (VSH)	7.00
10/3/2019	Went over brief one last time and sent back to Cockle for updating. (VSH)	2.75
10/3/2019	Cockle emailed a final proof for review. (VSH)	3.00
10/7/2019	Received printed copies of our brief and the OWCP brief in the mail. (VSH)	0.25

10/9/2019	Returned Mr. Kourianos phone call. Answered several of his questions concerning his case at the Supreme Court. (BA)	0.50
-----------	---	------

Attorneys:

JEW - Joseph E. Wolfe  
BA - Brad A. Austin  
VSH - Victoria S. Herman  
RW - Rachel Wolfe

Legal Assistants

ASB - Aaron Blair  
MJT - Mike Turner  
NAH - Nickie A. Hoffman